TR &, §.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

.51 -31.Te.-31.-30012026-269670
CG-DL-E-30012026-269670

T
EXTRAORDINARY
AW [I—E@vs 3—39-GVs (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

grfee ¥ THfaT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

g. 70] TE Reelt, gEeafaaTR, SHadt 29, 2026/9T 9, 1947
No. 70] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, JANUARY 29, 2026/MAGHA 9, 1947
g HATH

% feeett, 29 ST, 2026

arEL[. 713 —T g, gW R gthe (Few ¢ AR afaffaw, 1957
(1957 =T 67) =T &1 13 FIT T&T ATHAT T TART Fd gU, @iersT (HTarHT) 2w, 2015 Fr &l Fonfaa
T o foru Aeferied Faw aardt g, sria—

1. |ferT T A TR.— (1) =9 ==t #1 "fer /e afest (e e [, 2026 2
(2) T TSI § 3ok TRTA T LG FHI TIT g4
2. gfas (femf) e, 2015 §,—

(F) =7 9 F Iufa=w (5) F Tgl Uiqh H, “GLAT STHT & HTAH & eTeal o THTd, “STIAT AT T
TS F HILAH A" e S :wriod fhu ST,

(@) w10 % IufHaw (1F) §,—
(i) ST AT # AT e sate At i A T ST,

(i) &= (F) ¥, “dxg & % dae” oeai & v\ 9 S Fa 12 § gareaiEs we-FAoamee
st Saretie fad & fiae” orex oiiw stk T ST,

615 GI/2026 (D



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

(i) o FT AT AT ST,
g;)@ﬁawﬁ%wﬁaw(zﬁ, “gfarsgiar [ErdT 3 ATeaw &7 orsat & v, Feferfea sasetua B
“qT FTLAT 3-F H FarfafAfde v fagra § @Ay giay aie F Aveaw 77
(=) fe 13 & suffaw (3) & @ (i) § "=ImE" ore F T 9% "7 A e otes T STu;
(=) Faa 18 °,—
(i) 39-F=re (1) & o< &1 A AT ST,
(ii) IT-FF7 e (1%6) ¥, —
() sEfereR T & "o faearia arafar ersat, i & T st
(@) @< () |, “dag faq” ereat F v a7 “dareiie i ores T ST,
() TEGF T T fohart ST,
(=) = 19 & sufa=w (4) §,—
(i) “sITI9fa STHT % ATea9 |7 % TETq Mereed e B Sroi—
“storat AT 4-% # 7ot fAfafde g # dar afay gt F Aveaw 77
(if) T2 R H, “Tfafa ST 9reat & T, AT ST Afdq i 9re7 HETd R S,
(®) A7 19 §,—

(i) U= (6) , “TTA9fT STHT F ATeAT F” =gl & TET, “AT ST JfA T F qATeqT F7
ore7 s -ETi fav ST,

(i) Suf==w (10) ®, @< (3) , “IATHT o THTIT I¥” Teal & THT, “HIESA A ® ATATHA %
ForT siterTe T Zoraifae SeATHY SrashTH g F= e & 87 97e2 s e fH Sso;

(¥ g 195 9§, —
(i) ST—Forr (1) &, —
(F) ST I 9T “Uag Al oreal T 9T “Garelie fam” e T ST,
(=) TG T AT {7 ST
(ii) ITf=H (2) H,—
(F) ©% (@) ¥, “Iug a0 asai F w19 9 “Gareie o’ ores T SATuT;
(@) TEIF T AT T ST
;j)qﬁﬁmr 1957 ®, Suta=w (2) ®, “yfagfa 597 F Areww & F wara Fufefa daenfg G
T AT 4— & 77 AR yrew § fiar wfag ate ¥ wreaw @7




[\ II—8vE 3(i)] HTL T (ST ETLTI0T 3

) “SgET 37 % wETd, e saet sid e i ST, st —

“STIEAT 3
ftar gy e 7 g9
[Fara 12(2) 34

[t TRt T Has ") [qTTE]

qaTH

TSIYT [T T ATH]

REL

FOAT ATAHTT 1956/2013 F Fefi 9w ® Ao [srfemmh Setreran/san s&oft #1 7)),
St T wg=T HedT [AfaaTT Srettarar/sar ol w1 Hrarsua], S TR e
[IIEET AT &7 9qT], WA g S FHIET H THE &A1 [FIEE & TH@ S &7 94T, 0
TR Tt & T 1) o7orar [safs &1 AmH] ST AT FT AR g, S 91 s et
QAT € AT [6eAT] g, [qa1] 1 Fawh §, sraer [qniert wH/atewnt w1 a9z Sas a9t qae
TTEA T AN 8, ST AT 6 (FaTe g {Sreh HaTe &7 @ £ [FIAT o €479 &7 9471 | 2,
[“srfermTeT Srehtarar/seme seoft”] i (Frearee sfasg dar f aarfeg £ arda [ arie”) a5
ey AT fATITET F T H ASUAT [317eh2] [HTAT FAU (ersat H)] F 0 6 F o erdfage
TF ANTAEE LT AT T T % €T H TATI( AT TUTerT 2

T A7 AfEmTT aretiarar/aa™ it & = Fearfea BT s arer @@ B i s
FOE (FIFT €T F ) Frareft (et 1 fBawon) F gee & arde [arda)] F i e

& refie Feg Areare it qfd g T Aeured Tsaare [TsF w1 AT, (|T5E”) B TEC HAT
suferd g

STEATAT ATATETAT/TeTT 0T F SIqd 9% g6, (AT Hu«T AT 719) J9=T qrEr  (9”) =98
Fqfase eyt Ua odt u% ST hit HET 9T FAL F A1 AT AreAiarar/aarT Fwoft fi
FTEAATSAT T FRIAT T g ASUAT (ATHS) (AT ) [ersaT H] (“NTAS] qiE GA") TF 6T
THH TS I HETT Tl H F99 < 8l

: SAF, T STHTHAT T1T % T&T § SATHTAT FTATGTAT/TTT 0 T A T ATTTE Lol 17 3T
e HETT FHT T AT AT FLAT g Y HoTa 8 F2aT g, STeaiq—

7z far wfayg Te 9 Sur fems s GEm it erEsEiuers) g S
AEARE TS (T AT srearer) faenf==er, 2022 F gasT § i AAmRat grer Aoarfaa B s
=2

ST AATRAT =8 TATST T TT | I1oT T A 7R it T 9% Tehre 17 &l 396 [AfHiase
T B UHT AT % oI T TRT Wi FAThal astgi oreral




THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

(iif)

T T FLATT STAAT T FLA il ST I FALTHAT & (a7 AT FBhET A I8 92 T 3T
ATIHTAT FTATTAT/TLTT 0T % Hex Rt fFaTe srorar 9a9s & aras(@ ag Ty srrar et (U
AT e ITAl F HTEAH ) S ot it weArgia 7 7 srfaw 7 gy, oA G e, smee,
HfaTe, FATrd @t e & AT o TR a7 ST 91 9% §aETT FA 1 99 T gl T
Tt B o T STy AATHRAT F TAEl & arer | et =mamerr strar srfereeor & awer dfaa
ToRHT AT SToaT FATe! | SATHHTAT ST & TaT/TeTT 0T 1T Scav (el faare or9aT &arat &
I gU oft WifY T2 T7F9r T HETT T5F FT FIA T A=A T B

ST FTHTRAT g TR FIAT g o 1T Tl T(a9 TATRAT T T Al ST ATAT THH il 5T
T UET 1S ot AT F0E F el T A SAEmTT Sietiaran/aeT wlt gRy ger £ ST aredt
TR F "ag § FAw, arerr e [t | gem

ST S THTRAT GTT TS sl Q@ fehd LT STAET ATHAT ATl AT/ oM & I8 [T 79T T
HIT T T ATATFHAT T ZeTaT g ST AT BF TH TS Iie o Fefi= "qary g wiasy Srerendr 6
Tt ferfera \T 7 soqa F3 & @ et aretraran/sen it % fFeg s f&faes so=m
TSI GIT TIATT ST 1 STUTErT a1 o STae STHThAl o (he T TSR T dY gerar gl

T ATaeh S AATHRAT AT o o 7757 F FgAta w@dr g & 757 F ge gt i, foEr gfayg
FATHAT T AZHATT * S =7 W9 T F A Tia FrA1ha 1 6 ariaed Fl qF9I-997 9, et
&7 H yoriad foFu faar:

FIE o THaeT ST Aat &l a& 37 / AT ITLA T B

T & AT ATAHATAT FTARTAT/TLTT (T FreAal 6 [HoaTad g q9F 0 faeqa e/ a1 =&1f{q
T AT, STIAT

FIL F (HagaT 3T ot F defi SATHT=T Srefiarar/sen ol F fAeg T g J9=T0 S 91l
et srfereRme ot SIfaa Y@t AT Igcd HT Tl

Y Iia SETRar w1 UH RET T F FOT ATAT ST HF AR H G AMT AT SATAHTHAT

A TTAT/IETT 0T % T g1y T srqurg steram Bt s=r e st afasfaat & g&fad ffaw % sdi=
ST AATHRAT AT ST FHAAT T Toh Tl BT (e 39 ST g, TH T FTE * i AT Srwrehar o

ST ATEAATAT & T HTA HT TATF AT

6.

= et T s & ft ga T aque ud aEsT Y, I5EH, THEE, O, TR, hi,
FHIIT, FEITAAT ST Rt T SR T T, % Fwreor &, et wetfadl & g gl

gy SHTRaT GgATT aaT & o TsF o9 fAsheT a7 AT S @rar/IdTE R F AEg T
T FTAATET [T T/ i § W@ FUETdT & &9 H, T(a9 AT & [a%g o0 T 91 &l
AT A T ZHaTT NI

gfas AR T2 ST gegAfd aar ¢ & zaw AR saryfq, #w # AffEs safe % s @
TIE TATE H TF AN LWl 32 T2 7o T8 T T AN T30 9 T ATHHATT S &1 l/IemT ol &
AT (AITas o Sag § AT FIL 6 LT T AT I8 el THT Fided| =l [ aig Id qal
BT SITAT Sl 38 ITAl i A a1 I 37 ST T 57 Tg THIO Agl FHdT o qLear =eara
& Hae § srqae i fFw ud ot w1 @ avg vd s w0 # Sf 4w aretaran/sen it g
T AT T § i qaETe =) Tt & dee B s §) oo siafEte Gt e F e e
T, ST % FHTITH T A T TI4GT 39 TF e § Ay SHmedT 9% 560 AT & 4
Tl T STAAT ITAT Al ger AT SITAT TTae STHTRAT il TEAAL o7 TATH & e T Iracal
AT @l ST

TH TAT( & AT gias SHTRan g T T 1 39 g uR §1r 2q Tifasy ATt &
FIAET FT g I /AT SATOT Y 757 TET Ha1 F2 o (T I Srarewdt  faeg s arar g7
TEl T AT




[\ II—8vE 3(i)] HTL T (ST ETLTI0T 5

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

Tg WIS i ATea At fAfer  7efie 81 =9 Wias] e srorar ot fao aeq & w10 7T § [gafaa
TT] Icq= FFeT AT, FTATS TaT 97T FaTs 15T & ~JTATAd] & [FOT i & F orehi=
2

Ty HATHRAT F 916 T8 WA T T ST o &7 § ST FIA 7 ATAHR g1 TH T(A TS HT T
FIHTRAT F Tod H TRAAT 6 FATART (Hagd qgl AT ST TR

sty ATt forfead § s &t 93 Fgata & oE7 =0 9fay aie & S e F e afaegia
Tal FA & oIy a=aeg 2

TS, T STHTRAT 1 99 GA4T 51T, TRt o o, St sram o= a9t Aol &l
TH A9 ST o T SATEHTT T TR, ST TSAITH o ATH 9T AT 1| 36 T § ITSTA o f&ar,
g AT THIRLA T AT SEATALONT Al g

¥ siqfdte Rt a1 2ra gu o,

(F) =8 AT Fi© & T AT TAATHRAT T 1T AT THA & AT Tl 2T

(@) I WA aie g i qErg aF 97 g

gfas] SRl 38 TTA a7 (el TTas] aie it THH TqaT I [T 9T F HIT FT Fa [9h

ST g THT Jcadardl § IS T FHIH A G Hl FAAT IHH 9 Td9 SHRar & forrad
FTET AT HIT 49T FdT g

AT (Fare) 1 S T T 3 () A A

AqTeft § oreren Tl FHTRaT =, I ATEa STTerhT & G, STIAT geareAs 3T Higy 63T 2

(afasg SrwTRat it AreR)
(%) 36 =T, " 4 " % T, Feterted gt s T w ST, sEid—

"L 4-F
Y AT A Tawor rgta & forg s wfieg s F forg o=
[ 19 (4) 3T 1997 (2) 3]

[T SRt T Fas g [aE]

GELE]

REL



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

()

(@)

()

ot sferfad 1956/2013 F v W & AR [T Sifterarn/sen el #1 9],
FICANE TgATH HEAT [SATEHTHT Srefiarar/SaT Foft 7 Hemsua) afga, s Tt st
[TTEET AT T 94T], AT g A HATE F TG SIF [FRAT 6 T T F 94T, T
TR swraterT & f9=1 21 srorar [Sf® &1 8] ST 9 w1 AWE g, e o sy et
graT [€e] §, ... [aT] 7 FRamht g, oar [FRfarT wH°/z=tent 1 99] s a9t aae
TTEA T AR 8, 3T 9 & Far 8§ s Fea 7 T4 2019 [F#1E7 F T 67 9d7] €,
[“SrfermTt SreftaTar/saT ko] 1 (Reares fasg $wr i qarfea fi ardie (amfea aria”)
T T AT [AITET F FT § ASUAAT [3ihs] [ATAT €U (eT5aT H)] F THIT THA & o0
arafeargt Ud srafaegeoi ST Ay a7 & &7 § AT 397 Futerd g S (“HHTred fi aria’)
T qTrE | [* ] [* ] T SIS srater & forw e g

Tt (AT 7 fFEwon) F gy § v [arira] F [RfeET aEarest & e T areraret £ i
T [T T A1), (“TSA”) & ST il (HSITET FRAT TEA HLAT STUTETT g ST T97 ST ATSHTAT
FTATETAT/TETT 0T o = G AT T Ieamed w7 (ad &9 8 “F”) Aoarfaa o smer
ITaterg 2

STTEATAT FTSATGTAT/STET 0T o STre 9% gH, (AT SOt T A7) TqT qrET (“T9”) T8+ siafate
fAere= U orat U ST i GIRT 9T FALC F Fefi AT Svetiaran/SeTT ol v areaars wir
LT T@ I AEUAAT (ATh2) (AT 799) [ersat H] (“OTA Fie ThA") TF T T T &l
HETT FA AT TAT o gl Ad: T, TA SAHTHAT 75T 6 T&T | SATHAT AT TTaT/TETT 0T #ht
AT Tg AMAHLOT ST Aa¥ied HaTd ST (sl a1 AT FedT ¢ o7 FEgae qf2 #ar g,
HATL—

RERCIE: Ik G LA R AR B 10 2 e 7 R o e M1 2 ) B 2 s e | E WA EU S L
A TUaTS (AT AT ereare) fRert=aer, 2022 F a3 § Yias] dATwar g Aoarfead & s
T 2l

Sy AATRAT 38 TATST T T5T | I1oT T FA e 7R7 it T 9% Tehrer 17 &l 396 AfHiase
T FG THT AT o o0 T ALY g7 A S AT T asTal ST2aT FHIOT 1 I STaT qrierd
FTeA AT 5T ol SALARAT o ToAT 37 TRt ff 918 9% 57 ST SIS S QTan/SdT ot
T ToReT foraTe SreraT AaWg & STas(@ ag TTTLT STTar AT (U STIaT STtersh aTdl o ATed §) S
o5 et T oA /AT & stter 7 2, foAT Fhelt sy, sreeqor, sfase, [ sroar sy & o r
9T Tred TAT TATHT AL I HEGTT FlA 7 9 <l gl TN ST T ZI & eI T FAThal +
FTAT o Hae § Torelt =T rersr srora sTfershor o |wey Sfara Rt ATHer sToraT frarer § ATSHT T
FTATETAT/TET ot T Ieue Foheft farame srerat faamat & gra gu ot ARt 1 27fer 7 Hary asw
FT A AT F9 <dT 2

Ty FHTRAT g THIRIE FIAT g o T5F &1 TTas] AT ZIT &1 Al ST ATl LA il 157
FT Ut A AT ART F202 F T T A7 ATSHTAT SIATTar/SeT ol g7 S it S arev
TR o Hae § AW, Irewry e Rt ywer gRm

ST AATRAT FIT ST Al TATToha LTS STTAT ATTATAT ST [GTAT/TETT 0T & IEh Tohell Srer %l
AT F T AEFeTHAT T ATAAE FLAT g 3T O &7 =6 Ty Jive & = T2 gq iy
FrATeRat & et forfera /T &1 seqa e & T3 ST S [T/ e ol & foeg o fafes
STATE T T5F FIT ATATY ST 7 STUTET JATe o TTs] STATRAT & [he T STTERTY 7 | stfereas
AT gl

THE ATATIh T ATHTRAT (64T &d 6 15T | TgATd 1@l g o 1T &l e gt &, &ET Jiasg
STHTHRAT T TEHTT o S T8 TTA T F orefi T ATl & aTicd &/l THT-THT 97 et =9
ERENECRELREEIE

FL F AT 37 ot 7 a2 ST / AT UL FIT;




[\ II—8vE 3(i)] HTL T (ST ETLTI0T 7

(ii)

(iif)

T & e STTAATHT FATRTAT/TETT (T & FAAT 6 oI gq 997 &l faeqa o7/ a1 =1060q
T HEHAT, AT

FOC F HagAT 3T ot & i SATHT=T Srefiarar/Sen ol F fFeg T g I9=T0 ST 91l
TRt sTfarerTed st e YAt AT Iged FT TR

ST Sy ATHTRAT H el HTE FTA AT FIA § AT 6 FIIT AT ST 6l AL T ATT T

ATEATAT AT/ O o 15T g7 et g o faret sreor S sfasgfaat & gefaa Faw
e wfas] SHTRaT H 386 FAAT § qh Tl HIM (e o0 3999 2q, 3 ATA TTE & (e Tfas]
FAATHAT T IERT ATLAAT T HTH FLA FHT TATT G

6.

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

=k A9 T s & off " Rt adwe ud aiEasy ¥, Sged, T, oo, TN, 6,
FHILET, FITaAT AT Rt T i T T, & FT |, et Fetadl & <6 gl

tasy ATRaT agatd ar g & T st fEeer aw srfee aretaran/senT ol F Feg yu
T FTAATET & 6T TIH Foeid H THE FKIETAT & QI 9%, a9 Al & Aaeg 39 VA e
Eﬁw*{ﬂaﬁr‘é%dli gl

i SHTRal I8 | TEATT <dT ¢ 6 260 Fafae T i T aregary, e # fafafase
FATY & IO T d8 Tged T AN LT 997 78 T T8 a9 TF Yo I 99 aF (i) ATTA=
FATRTAT/TLTT (T & e Meared & dae § FUd 2 & AR 92 qIqa7 394 AT qH4T
JTEAATT. TG HaT Al Bl SATAT 3T SHF 1T HT THTLTT AT ITHAA qgl a1 STaT TaT (ii) T
FAAT S T 5T g THIUT Agl HdT T LT (Aoarad & dae § F2 & Haw i odi 7 .1
e Ua 3T T H ATTHTAT A arar/TgT il g1 qre 6T 3T 2 ST aaqar 36 gargfd
FT IFHMEA T g1 ATT 04T (iii) @fast (A=) =, 2015 % =9 19 & 3u-fFaw (2) F aefia
FoReT derfara RaTa qaT &7 I9ad F3d U, ST AT a18 § g, Faga 7 gr s za6 et ama
& A gU AT, ST T Tasfd & Tl 77 AT q1aT S At o2 forfed & 79+ & i 9% a1
SHH TE gl HAT aF T V(A9 ATHTRAT 9T TH AT 6 STelie s T SATAT 14T Aol g
TR STTaT I SeTeRdT T TaAae o0 TATHId & e o+t arfeat & gaa w@r S

TH JeATHT % T Sy AATHRar g7 AT AT H3 T S 9T 63 gq Tiay SHTEar &
et &1 & i AT STOAft 3 Tro7 UAT HEr Fe % forw wfa Swrhat F e S @ g
Bl T AT

Tg giaq aie Area @it f&afd = o 81 39 vfas] afe srrar saet A awq & F0 157 | [qated
] Ieae Tl aTe, FTEATS STIaT 317 FTLATS TTST o ~ATATAAT & (A9 rfersre & = orefie
gt

ST ATHRAT & 916 6 V(A qTS Al ST 6 T&T § ST HLA A1 ATHE gl TH T T Fl 9y
STHTRAT o TS § TREAT F FACTET ITHIT=d Al [T ST TR

sfasy dtarRar forfaa § o7 &t 03 "ggata & &7 =9 9fayq aie 1 S @ & 0 afdsgia
el FA o forT a==eg 2

TS, T SHTRal 1 93 g1 g1, Tt sy o, wemert srrEr = e At i
T WAy a7 & AL ATAHT T TR, ST TSI 6 719 92 AW 2R1| 37 @€ § ITafed & Harm,
Tg TATHT AT TIAT geqraoiia qgi g

THH siqfate BT o1 F gra g oft,

F. =H I Fe % e Tfas] Swrewat &7 T Ty e F T 981 R

g. Tg WAy aie q9Tie T I8 T 71T g

Tt AATHAT el T8 ITA T2 F eI TIA T T T AT IHeh (el T 39T o HITT FT Fael
I & Faer a9t Icaeardy § TR TF a9 A aIE FTSTAET IHE TF T AT
o =TaT sreraT 9T Tor At g




8 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

[T, . TH.IV—2306/10/2025—@T IV—ATT(1)]
RIS SATAH, AT TATSHIL

feoqur: g9 Few 9 F TS, e, 9wl 8T 3, 39— T (i), dend anEn. 406(3),
I 20 #E, 2015 gRT YHIOE foRar o1 i sifaw 9w "@enrs |araEnf|. 776(3),
TG 22 3rFga?, 2025 g7 gerrterd = wam am

MINISTRY OF MINES
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 29th January, 2026

G.S.R. 71(E).— In exercise of the powers conferred by section 13 of the Mines and Minerals
(Development and Regulation) Act, 1957 (67 of 1957), the Central Government hereby makes the following rules further
to amend the Mineral (Auction) Rules, 2015, namely:—

1. Short title and commencement.— (1) These rules may be called the Mineral (Auction) Amendment Rules, 2026.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Mineral (Auction) Rules, 2015,—

(a) in rule 9, in sub-rule (5), in the first proviso, after the words “through security deposit”, the words “or through
insurance surety bond” shall be inserted;

(b) in rule 10, in sub-rule (1A),—
(1) in the opening portion, the words “or extended period” shall be omitted;

(i)  in clause (b), for the words “within fifteen days”, the words and figures “and furnish performance
security as specified in rule 12 within forty-five days” shall be substituted;

(iii)  the proviso shall be omitted;

(c) in rule 12, in sub-rule (2), after the words “through security deposit”, the following shall be inserted,
namely:—



[\ II—8vE 3(i)] HTL T (ST ETLTI0T 9

“or through insurance surety bond in the format as specified in Schedule I1I-A”;

(d) in rule 13, in sub-rule (3), in clause (a), for the word “Trust”, the words “and Development Trust” shall be
substituted;

(e) in rule 18,—
(i) in sub-rule (1), the proviso shall be omitted;
(i) in sub-rule (1A),—
(A) in the opening portion, the words “or extended period” shall be omitted;
(B) in clause (b), for the words “fifteen days”, the words “forty-five days” shall be substituted;
(C) the proviso shall be omitted;
() in rule 19, in sub-rule (4),—
(i) after the words “through security deposit”, the following shall be inserted, namely:—
“or through insurance surety bond in the format as specified in Schedule IV-A”;

(ii) in the first proviso, after the words “security deposit”, the words “or insurance surety bond” shall be
inserted;

(g) inrule 19E,—

(i) in sub-rule (6), after the words “through security deposit”, the words “or through insurance surety
bond” shall be inserted;

(ii) in sub-rule (10),—
(A) clauses (iv), (v) and (vi) shall be renumbered as clauses (i), (ii) and (iii), respectively;

(B) in clause (iii) as so numbered, after the words “on conclusion of the auction”, the words
“automatically by the online electronic auction platform for public view” shall be inserted;

(h) in rule 19G,—
(i) in sub-rule (1),—
(A) for the words “fifteen days”, at both the places, the words “forty-five days” shall be substituted;
(B) the proviso shall be omitted;
(i1) in sub-rule (2),—
(A) in clause (b) for the words “fifteen days”, the words “forty-five days” shall be substituted;
(B) the proviso shall be omitted;

(i) in rule 19H, in sub-rule (2), after the words “through security deposit”, the following shall be inserted,
namely:—

“or through insurance surety bond in the format as specified in Schedule IV-A”;



10 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

(j) after “Schedule 1117, the following Schedule shall be inserted, namely:—

“SCHEDULE III-A
Format of Insurance Surety Bond
[See rule 12(2)]

[Reference number of the Surety Insurer] [Date]

To
The Governor of [Name of State]
[address]

WHEREAS

A. [Name of the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor] incorporated in India under the Companies Act, [1956/2013]
with corporate identity number [CIN of the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor], whose registered office is at
[address of registered office], India and principal place of business is at [address of principal place of business,
if different from registered office] OR [Name of individual] who is citizen of India, having income tax permanent
account number [number], residing at [address] OR [partnership firm/association of individuals], all members of
whom are Indian citizens and residents of India whose principal place of business is at [address of principal place
of business] (the "Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor") is required to provide an unconditional and irrevocable
guarantee in the form of insurance surety bond for an amount equal to INR [figures] (Indian Rupees [words]) as
a performance security valid until [date of expiry of Insurance Surety Bond] ("Expiry Date").}

B. The Insurance Surety Bond for performance security is required to be provided to The Governor of [Name of
State], (the “State”) for discharge of certain obligations under the Tender Document dated, [date] with respect to
auction of [particulars of auction] and the Mine Development and Production Agreement to be executed between
the State and the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor (collectively the “Agreement”).

C. We, [name of the insurance company| through our branch at [name] (the “Surety Insurer”) at the request of the
Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor do hereby undertake to pay to the State an amount not exceeding INR [figures]
(Indian Rupees [words]) (“Surety Bond Amount”) to secure the obligations of the Preferred Bidder/Principal
Debtor under the Agreement on demand from the State on the terms and conditions herein contained herein.

NOW THEREFORE, the Surety Insurer hereby issues in favour of the State this irrevocable and unconditional guarantee
in the form of insurance surety bond on behalf of the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor and affirms as follows,
namely:—

1. This Insurance Surety Bond is being executed by the Surety Insurer in terms of the IRDAI (Surety Insurance
Contract) Guidelines, 2022, issued by the Insurance Regulatory and Development Authority of India (IRDAI).

2. The Surety Insurer for the purpose hereof unconditionally and irrevocably undertakes to pay to the State without
any demur, reservation, caveat, protest or recourse, immediately on receipt of first written demand from the State,
a sum or sums (by way of one or more claims) not exceeding the Surety Bond Amount in the aggregate without
the State needing to prove or to show to the Surety Insurer grounds or reasons for such demand for the sum
specified therein and notwithstanding any dispute or difference between the State and Preferred Bidder/Principal
Debtor on any matter whatsoever. The Surety Insurer undertakes to pay to the State any money so demanded
notwithstanding any dispute or disputes raised by the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor in any suit or proceeding
pending before any court or tribunal relating thereto the Surety Insurer’s liability under this present being absolute
and unequivocal.

3. The Surety Insurer acknowledges that any such demand by the State of the amounts payable by the Surety Insurer
to the State shall be final, binding and conclusive evidence in respect of the amounts payable by Preferred
Bidder/Principal Debtor to the State under the Agreement.

4. The Surety Insurer hereby waives the necessity for the State from demanding the aforesaid amount or any part
thereof from the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor and also waives any right that the Surety Insurer may have of
first requiring the State to pursue its legal remedies against the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor, before presenting
any written demand to the Surety Insurer for payment under this Surety Bond.



[\ II—8vE 3(i)] HTL T (ST ETLTI0T 11

5. The Surety Insurer further unconditionally agrees with the State that the State shall be at liberty, without the Surety
Insurer’s consent and without affecting in any manner the Surety Insurer’s obligation under this Surety Bond, from
time to time to: —

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

(1) vary and/or modify and of the terms and conditions of the Agreement;

(i) extend and / or postpone the time for performance of the obligations of the Preferred Bidder/Principal
Debtor under the Agreement; or

(iii) forbear or enforce any of the rights exercisable by the State against the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor
under the terms and conditions of the Agreement,

and the Surety Insurer shall not be relieved from its liability by reason of any such act or omission on the part
of the State or any indulgence by the State to the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor or other thing whatsoever
which under the law relating to sureties would, but for this provision, have the effect of relieving the Surety
Insurer of its obligations under this Surety Bond.

Any payment made hereunder shall be made free and clear of and without deduction for, or on account of, any
present or future taxes, levies, imposts, duties, charges, fees, commissions, deductions or withholdings of any
nature whatsoever.

The Surety Insurer agrees that State at its option shall be entitled to enforce this Surety Bond against the Surety
Insurer, as a principal debtor in the first instance without proceeding at the first instance against the Preferred
Bidder/Principal Debtor.

The Surety Insurer further agree that the Surety Bond herein contained shall remain in full force and effect
during the period that specified in the Agreement and that it shall continue to be enforceable till all the
obligations of the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor under or by virtue of the said Agreement with respect to
the Performance Security have been fully paid and its claims satisfied or discharged or till the State certifies
that the terms and conditions of the Agreement with respect to the Performance Security have been fully and
properly carried out by the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor and accordingly discharges this Surety Bond.
Notwithstanding anything contained herein, unless a demand or claim under this Surety Bond is made on the
Surety Insurer in writing on or before the Expiry Date the Surety Insurer shall be discharged from all liability
under this Surety Bond thereafter.

The payment so made by the Surety Insurer under this Surety Bond shall be a valid discharge of Surety Insurer’s
liability for payment thereunder and the State shall have no claim against the Surety Insurer for making such
payment.

This Surety Bond is subject to the laws of India. Any suit, action, or other proceedings arising out of this Surety
Bond or the subject matter hereof shall be subject to the exclusive jurisdiction of courts at the State of
[respective State].

The Surety Insurer has the power to issue this Surety Bond in favour of the State. This Surety Bond will not be
discharged due to the change in the constitution of the Surety Insurer.

The Surety Insurer undertakes not to revoke this Surety Bond during its currency except with the previous
consent of the State in writing.

The State may, with prior intimation to the Surety Insurer assign the right under this Surety Bond to any other
departments, ministries or any governmental agencies, which may act in the name of the Governor. Save as
provided in this Clause, this Surety Bond shall not by assignable or transferable.

Notwithstanding anything contained herein—
(a) the liability of the Surety Insurer under this Surety Bond shall not exceed the Bond Amount;

(b) this Surety Bond shall be valid up to the expiry date.

15. The Surety Insurer is liable to pay the surety bond amount or any part thereof under this Surety Bond only and

only if the State serves upon the Surety Insurer a written claim or demand on or before the expiry date.



12

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

Dated the [day] day of [month] [year] for the Surety Insurer.

In witness whereof the Surety Insurer, through its authorized officer, has set its hand and stamp.

(Name and Designation)

(Surety Insurer Stamp).”;

(k) after “Schedule IV”, the following Schedule shall be inserted, namely:—

“SCHEDULE IV-A

FORMAT FOR INSURANCE SURETY BOND FOR COMPOSITE LICENCE AND EXPLORATION
LICENCE

[See rules 19 (4) and 19H (2)]

[Reference number of the Surety Insurer] [Date]

To
The Governor of [Name of State]
[address]

WHEREAS

A. [Name of the Preferred Bidder] incorporated in India under the Companies Act, [1956/2013] with corporate identity

number [CIN of the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor], whose registered office is at [address of registered office],
India and principal place of business is at [address of principal place of business, if different from registered office]
OR [Name of individual] who is citizen of India, having income tax permanent account number [number], residing
at [address] OR [partnership firm/association of individuals], all members of whom are Indian citizens and residents
of India whose principal place of business is at [address of principal place of business] (the “Preferred
Bidder/Principal Debtor”) is required to provide an unconditional and irrevocable guarantee in the form of insurance
surety bond for an amount equal to INR [figures] (Indian Rupees [words]) as a performance security valid for an
initial period of [e] ([®]) years from the date hereof (“Expiry Date”).

B. The Performance Security is required to be provided to the Governor of [Name of State], (the “State”) for discharge

of certain obligations under the Tender Document dated, [date] with respect to auction of [particulars of auction]
AND the deed for grant of a prospecting licence to be executed between the State and the Preferred Bidder/Principal
Debtor AND the Mine Development and Production Agreement to be executed between the State and the Preferred
Bidder/Principal Debtor (collectively the “Agreement”).

C. We, [name of the insurance company] through our branch at [name] (the “Surety Insurer”) at the request of the

Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor do hereby undertake to pay to the State an amount not exceeding INR [figures]
(Indian Rupees [words]) (“Surety Bond Amount ) to secure the obligations of the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor
under the Agreement on demand from the State on the terms and conditions herein contained herein.



[\ II—8vE 3(i)] HTL T (ST ETLTI0T 13

NOW THEREFORE, the Surety Insurer hereby issues in favour of the State this irrevocable and unconditional
guarantee in the form of insurance surety bond on behalf of the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor and affirms as
follows, namely:—

1.

This Insurance Surety Bond is being executed by the Surety Insurer in terms of the IRDAI (Surety Insurance
Contract) Guidelines, 2022, issued by the Insurance Regulatory and Development Authority of India (IRDAI).

The Surety Insurer for the purpose hereof unconditionally and irrevocably undertakes to pay to the State without
any demur, reservation, caveat, protest or recourse, immediately on receipt of first written demand from the State,
a sum or sums (by way of one or more claims) not exceeding the Surety Bond Amount in the aggregate without
the State needing to prove or to show to the Surety Insurer grounds or reasons for such demand for the sum
specified therein and notwithstanding any dispute or difference between the State and Preferred Bidder/Principal
Debtor on any matter whatsoever. The Surety Insurer undertakes to pay to the State any money so demanded
notwithstanding any dispute or disputes raised by the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor in any suit or proceeding
pending before any court or tribunal relating thereto the Surety Insurer’s liability under this present being absolute
and unequivocal.

The Surety Insurer acknowledges that any such demand by the State of the amounts payable by the Surety Insurer
to the State shall be final, binding and conclusive evidence in respect of the amounts payable by Preferred
Bidder/Principal Debtor to the State under the Agreement.

The Surety Insurer hereby waives the necessity for the State from demanding the aforesaid amount or any part
thereof from the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor and also waives any right that the Surety Insurer may have of
first requiring the State to pursue its legal remedies against the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor, before
presenting any written demand to the Surety Insurer for payment under this Surety Bond.

The Surety Insurer further unconditionally agrees with the State that the State shall be at liberty, without the Surety
Insurer’s consent and without affecting in any manner the Surety Insurer’s obligation under this Surety Bond,
from time to time to:—

(i) vary and/or modify and of the terms and conditions of the Agreement;

(i1) extend and / or postpone the time for performance of the obligations of the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor
under the Agreement; or

(iii) forbear or enforce any of the rights exercisable by the State against the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor
under the terms and conditions of the Agreement,

and the Surety Insurer shall not be relieved from its liability by reason of any such act or omission on the part of the
State or any indulgence by the State to the Preferred Bidder/Principal Debtor or other thing whatsoever which under
the law relating to sureties would, but for this provision, have the effect of relieving the Surety Insurer of its
obligations under this Surety Bond.

Any payment made hereunder shall be made free and clear of and without deduction for, or on account of, any
present or future taxes, levies, imposts, duties, charges, fees, commissions, deductions or withholdings of any
nature whatsoever.

The Surety Insurer agrees that State at its option shall be entitled to enforce this Surety Bond against the Surety
Insurer, as a principal debtor in the first instance without proceeding at the first instance against the Preferred
Bidder/Principal Debtor.

The Surety Insurer further agrees that this Surety Bond and the guarantee obligations herein contained shall remain
in full force and effect and shall continue to be enforceable till: (i) all the obligations of the Preferred
Bidder/Principal Debtor under or by virtue of the said Agreement with respect to the Performance Security have
been fully paid and its claims satisfied or discharged; or (ii) till the State certifies that the terms and conditions of
the Agreement with respect to the Performance Security have been fully and properly carried out by the Preferred
Bidder/Principal Debtor and accordingly discharges this Surety Bond; or (iii) on provision of a revised
performance security under sub-rule (2) of rule 19 of the Mineral (Auction) Rules, 2015 whichever is later.
Notwithstanding anything contained herein, unless a demand or claim under this Surety Bond is made on the
Surety Insurer in writing on or before the Expiry Date the Surety Insurer shall be discharged from all liability
under this Surety Bond thereafter.

The payment so made by the Surety Insurer under this Surety Bond shall be a valid discharge of Surety Insurer’s
liability for payment thereunder and the State shall have no claim against the Surety Insurer for making such
payment.



14

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

This Surety Bond is subject to the laws of India. Any suit, action, or other proceedings arising out of this Surety
Bond or the subject matter hereof shall be subject to the exclusive jurisdiction of courts at the State of [respective
State].

The Surety Insurer has the power to issue this Surety Bond in favour of the State. This Surety Bond will not be
discharged due to the change in the constitution of the Surety Insurer.

The Surety Insurer undertakes not to revoke this Surety Bond during its currency except with the previous consent
of the State in writing.

The State may, with prior intimation to the Surety Insurer, assign the right under this Surety Bond to any other
departments, ministries or any governmental agencies, which may act in the name of the Governor. Save as
provided in this Clause, this Surety Bond shall not by assignable or transferable.

Notwithstanding anything contained herein,

(a) the liability of the Surety Insurer under this Surety Bond shall not exceed the Bond Amount; and
(b) this Surety Bond shall be valid up to the expiry date.

15. The Surety Insurer is liable to pay the surety bond amount or any part thereof under this Surety Bond only and only

if the State serves upon the Surety Insurer a written claim or demand on or before the expiry date.

Dated the [day] day of [month] [year] for the Surety Insurer.

In witness whereof the Surety Insurer, through its authorised officer, has set its hand and stamp.

(Signature)

(Name and Designation)

(Surety Insurer Stamp)].”.

Note:

[F. No. M.IV-2306/10/2025-Mines IV-Part(1)]
SHAKIL ALAM, Economic Advisor

The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part I, Section 3, Sub-section (i), vide
number G.S.R. 406(E), dated the 20" May, 2015 and was last amended, vide number G.S.R. 776(E), dated the
22" October, 2025.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-1 10064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. e




