TR &, §.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

Or.5M.-21.Te1.-31.-21012026-2694 89
CG-DL-E-21012026-269489

T
EXTRAORDINARY
AW [I—E@vs 3—39-GVs (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

grfee ¥ THfAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

q. 46] T FaeelY, WTeaTe, SFEdT 20, 2026/479 30, 1947
No. 46] NEW DELHI, TUESDAY, JANUARY 20, 2026/PAUSHA 30, 1947

e T IRET FHTT HH19d
(FaTEey i aiRET< Feror AT )

1L

T2 faeett, 20 STaT, 2026

L., 46(37).— iofer siw yamee arnft srfafam, 1940 (1940 T 23) &t gy 12 Y 3TemT
(1) 3% &7 33 T ITLTT (1) o 7l To7 srufera 7w sirwfer siw Aerfas wdieror R, 2019 ¥ i< Foras
LA o ToIT sRfaa AT T U YIS, AT 9T o TqTee 3T TIETE FHed T HATAT (FATEST 3T Iare
FegTor AT T srferg=aT Jeats ar.FT. . 588 (31), AT 27 R, 2025 F {TeqH T A & oI,
SATLTIT, 9T 2, @ 3, ITEE (i) § T Foham 13T o, e 37 a7 Ai<hat & e ofiT g7 e i=a
TR0 0 o, RS SEE TTEd g1 sl FATEET §, oY 39 JE o, q19 &1 it srater a8 g & Ige;
5 7 3 ATSGEAT AragIE FA ATAT TSI ol TTAAT STAAT Bl ITASE FAT &F T3 o,

AT I TN Y TAAT 28 3R, 2025 FHT AT o o707 IqeTeer 27 &F TS o,
3T 3h I AT 9% a1 | AT SAEdr Y AT 9L Ha T qEhE g A= AT @0 g

AA:, AT, FlT GLHIT I<h ATHIA BT g7 12 3T 8T 33 FRT T& Tt 7 TI0 Fd g0,
FATT TLHTL, ST ThAThT TATGHIL AT o ATT TLHI o TETA, 70 TS ¥ qa7= T0eq0r =,
2019 ¥ i< Helterd Fee o forw Fofated [ g g, g —

428 GI/2026 (1)



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

1. (i) = et =7 wfery A 7% sfwfer sie Seriee adveror (Feme) e, 2026 2 )
(if) T ST | I TR AT A F G (&1 & T2 T97 g

2. 9 Ut 3% AT e Haw, 2019 (58 =89+ T8 747 3 (Ha% #1141 8) ¥, e
52 ¥, -

() aTee ofteieh , "SHTA" €57 o T 9, "AqH T AT 0@ AT T SAT0;
(@) 39-fF=w (1) & = ax, Referfaa sa-fFaw T stroa, st
“(1) &re fF =afF FE agATa IR & UEr 92 shufer A7 seerweRs q% siufyr &
fafamtor % foro g=7 #2E1-10 (Form CT-10) & FiT ST ITTAFET FT Saad Fiieh
At aTe {3 fae, A= aier (clinical trial) 7T S-37ereeaT (bioavailability) T S-
TeaaT (bioequivalence) TeTaR e o forw AT qveaT, TreAvr i oo & forg et a2
ST AT ST IVITCH A% SITuTer T [AAHIT T51 HO:
g T s sfiT de-AaraeE e (T g, Arseeiteds, et dFed, stitad
GEASIEl aTel AT 3T T 3T J-TATET sirofet 1 aoft f 92 sfafdr e
HATUITCHE T SHUTE T ATAT FLd gU 6 (o0 T2 AT AT AeATOTHS 92 Sufer 6
fafamTor 7 T9r 7, FET AT TR F T&T HE1-10 H UF AT read 49 ga1

& FT H T HAT STTUAT ${i¥ Sreash UHT =T i ATHeaahid (acknowledgment) = e
¥ UHT sirotert #7 fAfAior w5 a1

@[  3S9-fAEw (2) T o BT ST,
(@)  3Su-FEg (3) ¥, "IU-FAEw (2)" oreal, FIYET SHY 3F F T UL, "SU-fAIAH (1)" 9reg,
FIYF AT IFF TAeqTioa o S

3. I A\l % Faw 53 #, -
() ST-F3H (1) ®, ST Fal 9 "Tod 1Y Q9" 9058 A1 &, Se7h €1 92 "TqTeA 1 w1
" oreg w SO,
(=) Y- (2) ¥, "o w fEw” st F T O, A wry et aew
ST,
) IU-F7w (3) F @2 (i) |, "ol 1Y faaq" osal F T 9%, "FqTeE F1d feaq” o
T SO

4. 3 Fawi & FEw 54 H, -
() ared offe |, "STATA" 957 % T U, "SAIT AT 09 ATl ATTEAFA o5
T ST,
(=) I9-f=w (1) ¥, "FFw 53 F qde T T FE-11 § T AqAfa” oeai, dF A7

AT & T, "7 HTw 52 F IT-A97 (1) & 9 % AT TF TAAT Al ATHEA i, STAT AT
HTHAT 21," 9I5%, HISF AT FF T T Fhu o,

@) SY-F9H (2) ¥, "AqET ATATA" TEaT & T I, "AqaT AqATT T (HF7 52 F I9-
A (1) & w3q % refie ST AtSrEedianta it Serdr, ST T 7T 21," 976), FISF AT F
staearTaa e ST

5. 3 Aot & faw 55 9, -
() ared oftier &, "erAta AT o reai F T L, AT AT TA TAAT T A" T
T S0,




[\ II—8vE 3(i)] HTL T (ST ETLTI0T 3

8.

(@) TR I ¥, "\ 53 F el T |IEr-11 § A" 9T5al, 3l i< A &
TET, "AT 77\ 52 % I7-F479 (1) F g & AL ATHEA I 9053, FEF T 37 w70 q
e ST,

@) @< (i) ¥ (iii) F T 9T, Feforted e @ S, a9iq; -

“(i) TaTTeet ST e AT F=| 52 % IT-MFH (1) o T3]  oTeld T GAAT il S ea (i
FT gTee, FoTreafa, ARG 92 Sirofaei #7 SUTRT Fae AqTHE e JT7 SAF-3Trserdr
T SIA-qeadT ALTAT FLA & TITSAL o6 70 AT AT, AT 37T AT & o 3 s
TAHT A1S ff AT ST | 91 9= SATuT A7 TRt ste =afRE AT stfsreRer A Ser a1 ¥
T AT TE AT ST,

(i) TR, smfa e a7 Faw 52 & su-ffaw (1) % =g F 94\ 9F gEar i
ATIEATHI T T, T2 ST AT FATAHTT, Faer AGTA T TLEAT AT SAT-3TAedqT AT S1a-
TEIAT ALTAT T o TASAT 6 (o0 AT GLrT, a0 i @gwer & fow =9 =4t F
SYSET % ATEL H T AT § i AR eaEt a2 a9 399 @fEEior y=7msi (Good
Manufacturing Practices) % fHgidi & SIaT | F4M,

(iii)zfRata, safa g a7 Jaw 52 % Iu-Faw (1) F 9g & Fehi" @ g=ar i
AT 1 g, AT 92 siufest siv 37 sttt @1 atvea e, e Bt
st o forw sirarfar i s i S &)

36 =i & ffaw 56 ¥, —

(F) SU-fATw (1) 9, "= 53 F el AqHia" e’ ¥ T & T, AT FAw 52 F
SU-F7w (1) & 93q F el F GAAT A ATHEAHIA" 9057, FSH AT fF q:emaa o
ST,

(=) -7 (2) #, "FFw 53 F T T=T HIEr-11 H SAIAA" 511, 3T A A 6
TET, "AT T 52 % I9-F39 (1) F T5q & AL @ AT i ATHEA TR, SET §T 7w
21, 9153, FTgF T 37 sfq:emrq fohy STu

I TF=HT & Mo 57 °, "AETT " 9TEat & €1 % "AqHTd 9T AT HEe 52 % I9-fAa
(1) 3 g = el TF GAAT 6 ATHEATHIT FT &7, 9163, FHITF AT 3 T AT
3 i €, Fgw 58 & e ww, Meferted R w@r S, sraiq -

“58. T SUTE AT SA=ATUTcH 5 siruteat & forw fAfawior safa a1 @ g==r &t stfvetaia #71

frera a1 TH |- (1) 9= 55 % STl % Tefid T2d gu, STgf TATHEATT, STafa a1 a1 @ a1
F srferEtta 1 e, srfafaem o == At & et off Sueg i e #39 § e w@ar g,
AT T SATATIT TTTAFTLE, IH ST Fl FHILT TATT T AGTEL & % THTT AL TAATS FT AFEL TZH
T o T, Torfed sraer g, Meferiad § | UF a7 T8 FAaredr % a6l g, TAQ -

(i) U sty % forw, ST St awett ST, i a7 9@ gEer i Ataedista w At w,
(ii) 9w 53 & T T=T HIET-11 H qaw ATATT AT TF TAAT il ATHEA I I & HLATI

(2) STt AT & AT & FAAT T STTTEATHIT T T, FOTehT STAHIT AT T TAAT T SATHEA R
ST-f7w (1) % st Rt [MefaT a7 8 #7371 2, FET SAATIT T 6 SAraer § AT
g, T8 AT T ATTH o &7 3T F e, Falg T Fl A4 FT T § AT g qER1E, THT 14
& THT, ST AALTF THHA 3T TS HT T TG FlA o T, IHh Hae H AT QLT A AT

Tl g, o amaer % a7 3w akfRafaat § aqi~a aw=1w S

9. ST F Raw 59 ¥, -

(i) ars offeies |, "SAHT" oTeR F T U, "AATT AT I[F FAAT" 9751 T ST,



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

(ii) -7 (1) F T, Fefered a3q iq:eaaa AT ST, & -

"oiq o STt Aot T (pharmaceutical formulation) #T & fafamTar, Rgwomers
AT e-AarE e (T g, Arscrereas, dier JFeq, Sifad geasiar are
FTITATSTFT 3T TATIF ST T TATET STt % Jant it 92 Ul ofiv seauoreas 95
sirarfer sroafSia #wa gu % forw /2 sirafer ar srearomerss 9 sfrafer % IuTae #7 ser Fwar
g, a1 Sus L & fFfemiar gy =7 #id-12 7 sfiw afhT Sus =¥ a (active
pharmaceutical ingredient) & faf#Tar =T T%=7 FE-13 F FFT ATATIA, TTTEFET FHT
Ut frwfer F fAfRwTor % forw qd g=ET F 9 ° UF AAAred A AT ST si7 srass
UHT AT 6T ATIEARIT o AT TT UHT ST F7 AT T T’ 21"

10. 3<% A9t F=w 60 ¥, STet el ot "o 1 feaw” erex o €, % w1 9 "darehie wr e
9TeT ¥ ST
11. 3% = & M9 61 #, -

(i) ared offds &, "SHTa" 95 % T UL, "AAHI AT A TAAT hf ATHEATHIA" o055
T STU,
(ii) -7 (1) ¥, "9 60 F otefi" w=q H1ET-14 a7 HIET-15 H e Aqaid” oTeal,
ST ST ST o T, AT e 59 F IU-f2H (1) 3 93 F (el TF =T o ATHE i
9Tex, Y 3T 3 - eqriua o sroar;
(iii) Y- (2) ¥, "AqET ATA" a1 6 T 9T, "SI AT AT a7 59 F 3I9-
e (1) % 93q & oTehT ST AfsrEediania i Jerar, ST ot 71T 21" 9158, HI9H AT ih
gfaesrioa fro sroan

12. 3% (=t |, W 62 % w9, Referfaa Faw v s, st -

“62. TrEor 7 fagwor AT AT THr 1 SAF-SUAsHAT SiT SHF-geddr AT & g gHRr
(formulation) ¥ fa=me g AT afda 9wt srawa & fafawtor & forg srafa ot @& gaar &
oI w1 Mea ar W -

(1) =7 60 & 3I9ae F AT T@d gU, ST LAHL AT a1 ahhT 9ust saga @=eiar
At &l =7 At & Gt ff Suae it e #39 # e @gar €, a1 R s
STTERTLY, ST AT T FTEL o 6 TAT AL GAATS F FGHL TG FA 6 TAT, oIfed sraer
g, Referfaa § & ue = srfas srdarfeat T a6, s -

THT srafyr & forw, S e awsht ST, FgrfRafy, semta a1 o gEer i gty i AeEa
AT, AT

A9 60 F 9 T=T HIEr-14 JT I=T HE1-15 H Sqaa FATRATT AqATT AT TF AT i
ATIEATHIT HT T HLATI

(2) St AR fafAAtar @ afr awst s f[AfRatan, S sqata @ qF g=an &
ATIEAFHIA IT-FH (1) F orele [t a7 T FT I G, FRIT STIATIA STl o QLT & 1A
g, 1 vET fAfawTar sreer it arte % Gqrette fGAt F FaT FRT TR F AT F FHhdT g 3T a8

LA, UHT ST 6 THT, ST A@eTF THA ST TS H7 AG9L T&T FA 6 T, 396 qa99 H
THT AT ITRA F Tl g, T AT & T2 o qRferfaat § agi=a a9 S’

13. 3 =T ®, M=\ 63 & v o, Moo = w@r ST, g -

“63. AT AT 7@ TAAT B ATAEATHQ FF a4 — =7 60 F 77 T HE1-14 a7 =7 HEr-15 |
ET AT AT T 59 3 IT-FA3H (1) o T3q o ST SATHITH TF AT Al ATHEA I (ST e
9Tat o STefe AT, AT —




[\ II—8vE 3(i)] HTL T (ST ETLTI0T 5

(i) TS AR AT AT IS TqIF AT AHTIGT, FATATT FFw7 60 F Tl Ser
FAta a1 = 59 F Iu-AFw (1) & g & A9 93 gEAT it AfFw=iF5ia, F argw w
fafafiia fe-srtted afr St sraaa F7 ITART Fad 398 AT st F forg Fwam,
T THHT e ff TI7 TSI § FE S=7 ST,

(i)  FuTrTT AAETT aTew A7 FEH 59 F 3u-ATw (1) F 9= & el ATHIie @ g=ew
FT ATIERFIT FT g, T GiRg AUS Ta99 AT ITHh AU LATH0T w1 fAf=aior saq
fafafae y=sET & for, =7 MeEt % STas & SIqgaeor # ofiT S9N [AieE Sl 9% F3,
e 7t Uy srwfert w1 AT q=rieeE aier A1 SE-SesgaT i Sa-qeddr AeTgT %
foro 2, a1 =8 39w Afawtr st % fgiar & aqeee § [T fer s =R,

(iy @@= (i) # AT qusr T 6w qfra Sus s #&1 @, somw, &R,
STANT it T2, TRt AT fq & e &t 12 sirafer &t wr o 3a gated o fowat &+
Iueteta w2 & forw afy strarewe srferg TaT; sfiT

(iv)  STer =8 60 & srefie ST st a7 == 59 & SU-fA=w (1) & wig & oFefig &
AT HF ATTEAFIA & Ao # AT SAqAIad e AU AqTF AT HIST A 0T
A = ST 8 AT FH9T ST F gt & A7 eAfaueq 21 AT 8 A7 SEht A AT q9TH 2v
TS g AT ag AAHTHH [UIET T THET TAT &, T IH T8 FHT (AT STUIT AT 396 qaeg | Aif T2
FATS Atafertad T ST’

14. 3 i F Raa 64 ¥, -

(F) I9-F=w (1) 9, "F=w 60 F orefie SAqafa” ereai Sii¥ sihi & T=rq, "7 {97 59 +
SU-F7w (1) % 93q % e Afehiaia” sz, FI9F 7 ofF siq:earaq o ST,

(@) SY-f97H (2) H, AT 60 F e w7 HEr-14 T HIET-15 H Iqa Aqard” oTeal,
ST ST A & T, AT FaE 59 % 3u-AEw (1) F wiq & AT I @ gEar dr
ATAEATHIA" oTeq, HTTH 3T 37 FT:EATTIq T o

15. 3 =+t & 2w 66 ¥, 39-H9 (2) & = o, Meferfaa So-Raw @ stroam, st -

“(2) STt fareT 9 shafer A seawuTeRs 4 sfafer #r At swta awE a1 @ g A
ATHEATHIT F ogTeaw g7 et srer =rfr o At foram Siar g, a1 ag UHT s fer & Fedw & e o
TATHATaT &7 917 37 9aT 3% 37 Ak FT A9 ¥ Iqr O THehr Arqfd it 97 TEr 8, 9T g v
SATTer T AT A7, T1 AT f, T dg HaH ST UHT A0S T Tg=1 Fed § g7 70T 7 98
T e forw =8 fafAfea fra = 8, i swefsha s

16. 3 =T &t et T =T |, —
(F) TET HE-10 ¥, — (i) ofidF &, "sqafa yam w2 F ot ot F wanq, A @

AT  [orT" 9167 &A1 TR0 STTURT; (i) TS 977 ¥, "SI Y& e & o0 sireas
9T&3T % T, "IT T AT % &9 H" 967 - #ATAq [0 S0

(=) T=T HET-12 #, — (i) ofidF &, "o qafd T&= F & o0 et & T, "9 @
AT % forw" o167 Siq:ETiaa fohT ST, (i) ST 977 &, "o ia Y& e & o7 areres
9T&RT % T, "IT T AT 6 &9 H" 61 Sq:e10q 0 S0
@) T HET-13 H, — (i) o0 7, "SIl TaT e o [oru” ereai & TETq, "7 I AT
& Tore” ore7 sia:eaTiaa o SO (i) ST 97 o, "STA T T&TH e o (oI sfraae" 9reat
& TAT, "AT T AT 6 &7 H" 967 Sq:#A10q 0 Sru|

[®T. . X11014/05/2025-31317]




6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

feroqur: J0 sirwfer sie A=rfae aderor A, 2019, WA % TSI, STETLT, 9T- 2, §F 3, 3uEe (1) §
ATE=AT et a1, FT.4. 227 (31), T 19 6= 2019 F AAH F Tah1irq Fohw 77 o e ffaw
T ATg=AT HErd qr.ALA. 581 (31), AT 19 v, 2024 F ATeaw | genfaa B 1w o

MINISTRY OF HEALTH AND FAMILY WELFARE

(Department of Health and Family Welfare)
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 20th January, 2026

G.S.R. 46(E).—Whereas a draft of certain rules further to amend the New Drugs and Clinical Trials Rules,
2019 was published, as required under sub-section (1) of section 12 and sub-section (1) of section 33 of the Drugs and
Cosmetics Act, 1940 (23 of 1940) vide notification of the Government of India in the Ministry of Health and Family
Welfare (Department of Health and Family Welfare) number G.S.R. 588 (E), dated the 27™ August, 2025, in the Gazette
of India, Extraordinary, Part II, section 3, sub-section (i), inviting objections and suggestions from persons likely to be
affected thereby, before the expiry of a period of thirty days from the date on which the copies of the Gazette containing
the said notification were made available to the public;

And whereas, copies of the said Gazette were made available to the public on the 28™ August, 2025;

And whereas, objections and suggestions received from the public on the said draft rules have been considered
by the Central Government;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by section 12 and section 33 of the said Act, the Central
Government, after consultation with the Drugs Technical Advisory Board, hereby makes the following rules further to
amend the New Drugs and Clinical Trials Rules, 2019, namely: —

1. (i) These rules may be called the New Drugs and Clinical Trials (Amendment) Rules, 2026.
(1) They shall come into force after forty five days from the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. In the New Drugs and Clinical Trials Rules, 2019 (hereinafter referred to as the said rules), in rule 52, —

a. in the marginal heading, for the word “permission”, the words “permission or prior intimation” shall be
substituted;

b. for the sub-rule (1), the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely: —

“(1) No person shall manufacture a new drug or an investigational new drug to conduct clinical
trial or bioavailability or bioequivalence study or for examination, test and analysis without
obtaining permission, by making an application in Form CT-10 to the Central Licencing Authority
to manufacture such new drug or investigational new drug, from the Central Licencing Authority:

Provided that in case of manufacture of new drug or investigational new drug for
analytical and non-clinical testing (excluding the new drug and investigational new drug of
category of sex hormones, cytotoxic, beta lactum, biologics with live microorganism and narcotics
and psychotropic drugs) an online application in Form CT-10 to the Central Licencing Authority
shall be submitted as prior intimation and the applicant may manufacture such drugs based on the
acknowledgment of such intimation.";

c. sub-rule (2) shall be omitted,;

d. in sub-rule (3), for the word, brackets and figure “sub-rule (2)”, the word, brackets and figure “sub-rule (1)”
shall be substituted.

3. In the said rules, in rule 53, —

a. in the sub-rule (1), for the words “ninety working days” wherever they occur, the words “forty-five working
days” shall be substituted,

b. in the sub-rule (2), for the words “ninety working days”, the words “forty-five working days” shall be
substituted;

c. in the sub-rule (3), in clause (ii), for the words “ninety working days”, the words “forty-five working days”
shall be substituted.



[\ II—8vE 3(i)] HTL T (ST ETLTI0T 7

4. In the said rules, in rule 54, —

a. in the marginal heading, for the word “permission”, the words “permission or acknowledgement of prior
intimation” shall be substituted;

b. in sub-rule (1), after the words, figures and letters “permission granted under rule 53 in Form CT-11", the
words, brackets and figures “or the acknowledgement of prior intimation under the proviso of sub-rule (1) of
rule 52 as the case may be,” shall be inserted;

c. in sub-rule (2), for the words “permission granted”, the words “permission granted or the validity of
acknowledgement issued under the proviso of sub-rule (1) of rule 52, as the case may be,” shall be
substituted.

5. In the said rules, in rule 55, —

a. in the marginal heading, for the words “Conditions of permission”, the words “Conditions of permission or
prior intimation” shall be substituted;

b. in the opening paragraph, after the words, figures and letters “permission under rule 53 in Form CT-117, the
words, brackets and figures “or the acknowledgment under the proviso of sub-rule (1) of rule 52 shall be
inserted;

c. for the clauses (i) to (iii), the following clauses shall be substituted, namely: —

“(1) the holder of the permission or acknowledgment of prior intimation under the proviso of sub-
rule (1) of rule 52, as the case may be, shall make use of new drugs manufactured only for the
purposes of conducting clinical trial or bioavailability and bioequivalence study or for
examination, test and analysis and no part of it shall be sold in the market or supplied to any other
person or agency or institution or organisation;

(i1) the holder of the permission or acknowledgment of prior intimation under the proviso of sub-
rule (1) of rule 52, as the case may be, shall manufacture new drugs only for the purposes of
conducting clinical trial or bioavailability and bioequivalence study or for examination, test and
analysis in small quantities in accordance with the provisions of these rules and at places specified
and in accordance with the principles of Good Manufacturing Practices;

(iii) the holder of the permission or acknowledgment of prior intimation under the proviso of sub-
rule (1) of rule 52, as the case may be, shall keep a record of new drugs manufactured and persons
to whom the drugs have been supplied for specified purposes; ™.

6. In the said rules, in rule 56, —

a. in sub-rule (1), after the words and figures “permission under rule 53”, the words, brackets and figures “or
the acknowledgement of prior intimation under the proviso of sub-rule (1) of rule 52” shall be inserted;

b. in sub-rule (2), after the words, figures and letters “permission under rule 53 in Form CT-11”, the words,
brackets and figures “or the acknowledgment of prior intimation under the proviso of sub-rule (1) of rule 52,
as the case may be,” shall be inserted.

7. In the said rules, in rule 57, for the words “permission holder” the words, brackets and figures “permission
holder or the holder of the acknowledgment of prior intimation under the proviso of sub-rule (1) of rule 52,”
shall be substituted.

8. In the said rules, for rule 58, the following rule shall be substituted, namely: —

“58. Suspension or cancellation of manufacturing permission or acknowledgment of prior intimation for new drug or
investigational new drugs.— (1) Subject to provisions of rule 55, where the permission holder or the holder of
acknowledgment of prior intimation, as the case may be, fails to comply with any provision of the Act and these rules,
the Central Licencing Authority may, after giving that person an opportunity to show cause and after affording an
opportunity of being heard, by an order in writing, take one or more of the following actions, namely: —

1. suspend the permission or acknowledgment of prior intimation for such period as considered appropriate;
il. cancel the permission granted under rule 53 in Form CT-11 or acknowledgment of prior intimation.

(2) Where the permission holder or the holder of acknowledgment of prior intimation, whose permission or
acknowledgment of prior intimation has been suspended or cancelled, as the case may be, under sub-rule (1), is
aggrieved by an order of the Central Licencing Authority, he may, within sixty days of the receipt of the order, make an
appeal to the Central Government and that Government may, after such enquiry, as deemed necessary and after affording
an opportunity of being heard, pass such order in relation thereto as may be considered appropriate in the facts and
circumstances of the case.”.



8 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

9. In the said rules, in rule 59, —

1. in the marginal heading, for the word “permission”, the words “permission or prior intimation” shall be
substituted;
ii. after the sub-rule (1), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely: —

"Provided that where a manufacturer of a pharmaceutical formulation intends to procure new drug
or investigational new drug for analytical and non-clinical testing (excluding the new drug and
investigational new drug of category of sex hormones, cytotoxic, beta lactum, biologics with live
microorganism and narcotics and psychotropic drugs) an online application to manufacture such drug
shall be made, as prior intimation, to the Central Licencing Authority by the manufacturer of
pharmaceutical formulation in Form CT-12 and manufacturer of the active pharmaceutical ingredient in
Form CT-13 and the applicant may manufacture such drugs based on the acknowledgment of such
intimation.".

10. In the said rules, in rule 60, for the words “ninety working days” wherever they occur, the words “forty-five
working days” shall be substituted.

11. In the said rules, in rule 61, —

i in the marginal heading, for the word “permission”, the words “permission or acknowledgement of prior
intimation” shall be substituted;

ii. in sub-rule (1), after the words, figures and letters “permission granted under rule 60 in Form CT-14 or CT-
15, the words, brackets and figures “or the acknowledgement of prior intimation under the proviso of sub-
rule (1) of rule 59” shall be inserted;

1. in sub-rule (2), for the words “permission granted”, the words, brackets and figures “permission granted or
the validity of acknowledgement issued under the proviso of sub-rule (1) of rule 59, as the case may be”,
shall be substituted.

12. In the said rules, for rule 62, the following rule shall be substituted, namely: —

“62. Suspension or cancellation of permission or acknowledgment of prior intimation to manufacture unapproved active
pharmaceutical ingredient for development of formulation for test or analysis or clinical trial or bioavailability and
bioequivalence study. —

(1) Subject to provision of rule 60, where the formulation manufacturer or an active pharmaceutical ingredient
manufacturer fails to comply with any provisions of the Act and these rules, the Central Licencing Authority may, after
giving an opportunity to show cause and after affording an opportunity of being heard, by an order in writing, take one
or more of the following actions, namely: —

i suspend the permission or acknowledgment of prior intimation, as the case may, for such period as
considered appropriate; or

il. cancel the permission granted under rule 60 in Form CT-14 or Form CT-15 or acknowledgment of prior
intimation, as the case may be.

(2) Where the formulation manufacturer or active pharmaceutical ingredient manufacturer whose permission or
acknowledgment of prior intimation has been suspended or cancelled under sub-rule (1), is aggrieved by an order of the
Central Licencing Authority, such manufacturer may, within forty-five days of the receipt of the order, make an appeal
to the Central Government and that Government may, after such enquiry, as deemed necessary and after affording an
opportunity of being heard, pass such orders in relation thereto as may be considered appropriate in the facts and
circumstances of the case”.

13. In the said rules, for rule 63, the following rule shall be substituted, namely: —

“63. Conditions of permission or acknowledgement to prior intimation. — The permission granted under rule 60 in Form
CT-14 or Form CT-15 or the acknowledgement of prior intimation obtained under the proviso of sub-rule (1) of rule 59
shall be subject to following conditions, namely: —

1. the manufacturer of pharmaceutical formulation or the active pharmaceutical ingredient shall make use of the
unapproved active pharmaceutical ingredient manufactured on the basis of permission issued under rule 60 or
the acknowledgement of the prior intimation under the proviso of sub-rule (1) of rule 59,as the case may be,
only for the purposes specified therein, and no part of it shall be sold in the market;

il. the holder of permission or the acknowledgement of the prior intimation obtained under the proviso of sub-
rule (1) of rule 59,as the case may be, shall manufacture such active pharmaceutical ingredient or its
pharmaceutical formulation for the purposes as specified therein, in accordance with the provisions of these
rules and at places referred to therein, and in case, the manufacture of such drugs is for clinical trial or



[\ II—8vE 3(i)] HTL T (ST ETLTI0T 9

bioavailability and bioequivalence study, it should be manufactured in accordance with the principles of
Good Manufacturing Practices;

iii. the manufacturer of a pharmaceutical formulation and active pharmaceutical ingredient referred to in clause
(i), shall keep all necessary records to indicate the quantity of drug procured, manufactured, used, disposed of
in any manner and other matters related thereto; and

iv. where unapproved active pharmaceutical ingredient and pharmaceutical formulation manufactured in
accordance with the permission issued under rule 60 or the acknowledgement of the prior intimation under
the proviso of sub-rule (1) of rule 59 is left over or remains, unused or gets damaged or its shelf life has
expired or has been found to be of substandard quality, the same shall be destroyed and action taken in
respect thereof shall be recorded”.

14. In the said rules, in rule 64, —

a. in sub-rule (1), after the words and figures “permission under rule 60”, the words, brackets and figures “or
the acknowledgement under the proviso of sub-rule (1) of rule 59 shall be inserted;

b. in sub-rule (2), after the words, figures and letters “permission granted under rule 60 in Form CT-14 or CT-
157, the words, brackets and figures “or the acknowledgement of prior intimation obtained under the proviso
of sub-rule (1) of rule 59” shall be inserted.

15. In the said rules, in rule 66, for the sub-rule (2), the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely: —

“(2) Where a new drug or an investigational new drug is manufactured by the holder of permission or acknowledgement
of prior intimation, on behalf of another person, he shall indicate on the label of the container of such drug, the name
and address of the manufacturer and the person to whom it is being supplied along with the scientific name of such drug,
if known, or the reference which shall enable such drug to be identified and the purpose for which it is manufactured.”.

16. In the said rules, in the Eighth Schedule, —
a. inForm CT-10, —

i. in the heading, after the words “FOR GRANT OF PERMISSION”, the words “OR OF PRIOR
INTIMATION?” shall be inserted;

il. in the opening paragraph, after the words “apply for grant of permission”, the words “or as prior intimation”
shall be inserted.

b. inForm CT-12, —

1. in the heading, after the words “FOR GRANT OF PERMISSION”, the words “OR OF PRIOR
INTIMATION” shall be inserted;

il. in the opening paragraph, after the words “apply for grant of permission”, the words “or as prior intimation”
shall be inserted.

c. inForm CT-13, —

i in the heading, after the words “FOR GRANT OF PERMISSION”, the words “OR OF PRIOR
INTIMATION?” shall be inserted;

ii. in the opening paragraph, after the words “apply for grant of permission”, the words “or as prior intimation”
shall be inserted.

[F. No. X11014/05/2025-DR]
HARSH MANGLA, Jt. Secy.

Note: The New Drugs and Clinical Trials Rules, 2019 were published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part-II,
section 3, sub-section (1) vide notification number G.S.R.227(E), dated the 19th March 2019 and last amended
vide notification number G.S.R. 581 (E), dated 19th September, 2024.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.  opakiia NATH YADAVA Sy sonedby GORAKHANAT

Date: 2026.01.21 16:09:15 +05'30"



		2026-01-21T16:09:15+0530
	GORAKHA NATH YADAVA




