It 4. S1.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

The Gazette of India

1.3, -3).TeA.-37.-08052025-262985
CG-DL -E-08052025-262985

STETHTIT
EXTRAORDINARY
AT II—ETvS 3—39-9Us (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

T F THAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

|, 255 ¢ Reelt, gEeafiam, a8, 2025/39m 18, 1947
No. 255] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, MAY 8, 2025/VAISAKHA 18, 1947

ITHIFAT ATHS, G T qraeias fAawr 6«
(@Ter S "rasttas fagwor fawm)

feg=T
7% faeet, 8 W, 2025

ar.FT1.f. 298(31).— F= e, Arewmer (B i fAfa=m) sitafam, 2007 (2007 =1 37)
FT g7 50 HF ITATT (2) F @< (F), @ () AT @€ () FRT T&T ARRAT HT TIN Fd g0, HISHT
(Frrrer s fafaese) aiermer &1 deredseor Ham, 2017 &7 siT "gera w3 & forg fMsfortea A
FATAT &, STATL-

1. (1) == et = "term am wiermer (B =i AfRaae) aiermer &1 i (gerreE) e,
2025 2

(2) T TISTIS § IeTeh THT ol TG T T ZT|

3036 GI/2025 (1)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

2. wizwmrr (e & fafaeame) wiswm &1 e ffam, 2017 9,- Baw 11 % safaaw (2) 4
"15 FTATeaE" FEI T RN 6 T 92 "7 FATEq" 37 AT 758 T A0,

3. 3<% Fam & e 12 9-
(i) Sufa=| (1) ¥, “21 Frafeaq” aeai & ¥ U, “7 Frafeaq” 98 T AT,

(ii) ST-FH=H (2) F 9igF H, "21 FEATEE" FFT ST 9q=al % I UL, "7 FwrAfeaq” 3w 37 e T AT
[T, &, 55/2021- 4=T2- 1]

v =+, Fp AP

oo e (e sie AR e 1 Tt e, 2017, S F T, ST,
am I, @ 3, 3UET (i) H eI ar.HL M .-165(3) ara 23 wLadt, 2017 gTeT i & 7w
o T Trg, ATAH AT HeATh ar.HL . 311(3T) T 4 54, 2024 F1=T "ertera omam w=m = |

MINISTRY OF CONSUMER AFFAIRS, FOOD AND PUBLIC DISTRIBUTION
(Department of Food and Public Distribution)
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 8th May, 2025

G.S.R. 298(E).— In exercise of the powers conferred by clauses (a), (b) and (c) of sub-section (2) of section
50 of the Warehousing (Development and Regulation) Act, 2007 (37 0f 2007), the Central Government hereby makes
the following rules further to amend the Warehousing (Development and Regulation) Registration of Warehouses
Rules, 2017, namely: -

1.(1) These rules may be called the Warehousing (Development and Regulation) Registration of Warehouses
(Amendment) Rules, 2025.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Warehousing (Development and Regulation) Registration of Warehouses Rules, 2017,- in rule 11, in sub-rule
(2) for the words “fifteen working days” the words “seven working days” shall be substituted;

3. In the said rules, in rule 12-

(i) in sub-rule (1), for the words “ twenty - one working days”, the words “seven working days” shall be
substituted;

(i1) In sub-rule (2), in the proviso, for the words “twenty-one working days”, the words “seven working days”
shall be substituted.
[F. No. 55/2021- Stg-II]

ANITA KARN, Jt. Secy.

Note- The Warehousing (Development and Regulation) Registration of Warehouses Rules, 2017 were published in
the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, section 3, subsection (i), vide number G.S.R- 165(E), dated the
23rd February, 2017 and last amended vide number G.S.R. 311(E), dated the 4th June, 2024.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. g xmar

SRIVASTAVA




		2025-05-08T22:25:15+0530
	SARVESH KUMAR SRIVASTAVA




