TR &, §.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

Gr.5M.-31.Te1.-31.-02052025-262838
CG-DL -E-02052025-262838

ETITIOT
EXTRAORDINARY
AT | —ave 3—SI-T@7 (i)
PART I1—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

TR & THTIAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

€. 241] 7% faeeft, gEeafams, wE 1, 2025/39m@ 11, 1947
No. 241] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, MAY 1, 2025/VAISAKHA 11, 1947
FforsT AR I=T HATey
CEINEELT R INIRC S CIRSER L))

75 faeedt, 24 =191, 2025

T, 284(s1).- fawwes =, 2008 #T &fiw Hergw w4 & forw, wfaux =t #1 wrew,
AT o TSI, STETYTIOT, AN ||, @€ 3, SU-9UvE (i) § AT TLh1E, AT 3f¥ ST GATAT (S
AL ST A AT FamT) it sferg=ET gem T anFn.[. 30(3) ariE 13 S\asr, 2025 3T, 3%
ATEAAT AT FIA AT TSI AT ITAAT AT F 0 Iuerser g0 & | fam it srater goreq g 7
Tl 39 AT AT, S ST TATET g A 9T g, ¥ ST i A SHAT A & [
FENIBGAERIRIRIRIS
ST, IFA TSI ATERAAT ¥ AT 13 AT, 2025 FT AT I ITAH FAT2 T 2fF;
Y, IFd AT | AT | e AT AT AT T Al g0 2,
A AT, FealT GLRTE TAehies Aiafaw, 1884 (1884 F1 4) ¥ &7 5 GIT Tacd ATTHAT FT TANT FLd
gu, faewes fAaw, 2008 FT T Herreae Fed & forg Metated {am aqrdr g, o771iq -
1. (1) =7 At &1 gfereg A fAewes (Ferree) =, 2025 2

(2) T TSI § T THTIF AT a1 0 Tg<d gl

2877 G1/2025 @)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

2. faeFres e, 2008, 57 T8 THF THETq S R\ #7137 8, & 997 106 3, @< (3) F7 A7 fFhar
STTUAT,
3.3 Rt R 1124 -
(F) Iu-f=m (1) ¥, "= A aut” eat & w0 9T, S A aut ass W S,
(@) IU-=| (8) ¥, " A" 9TeaT ok TATA UL, "IH TU" 9Tex T SATUA|
[FT.5.2(3)/2019-Fa=hres-amT (4)]
ST, HLAT oo, HIh A=

forequr- oot o e 3 Troro, srTemeor & srfergEET et AL 907 (), ardE 29 e, 2008
FTT IO TR0 10 3 i qeqe=ma srferg=eT gt a1.#1.f4.65 (31) e 24 s=ast, 2011, 9r.#1.4.
772 (3) A 11 frdaw, 2013 =7 ar.F1.M. 17(30) a0 9 SaT, 2019, S.0E.A7. 633(5) aE 11
FFZaT, 2024 FRT ZAH "evaa AT wm

MINISTRY OF COMMERCE AND INDUSTRY
(DEPARTMENT FOR PROMOTION OF INDUSTRY AND INTERNAL TRADE)
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 24™ April, 2025

G.S.R. 284(E).— WHEREAS the draft of certain rules further to amend the Explosives
Rules, 2008, were published, vide notification of the Government of India in the Ministry of
Commerce and Industry (Department for Promotion of Industry and Internal Trade) number, G.S.R. 30
(E), dated the13™ January, 2025 in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part-II, Section 3, Sub-section
(i), inviting objections or suggestions from all persons likely to be affected thereby before the expiry of
a period of thirty days from the date on which the copies of the Gazette containing the said notification
were made available to the public;

AND WHEREAS the copies of the said Gazette notification were made available to the public on the
13" January, 2025;

AND WHEREAS no objection or suggestions were received from the public within the said period;
NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by section 5 of the Explosives Act, 1884 (4
of 1884), the Central Government hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Explosives

Rules, 2008, namely:-

1. (1) These rules may be called the Explosives (Amendment) Rules, 2025.
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In rule 106 of the Explosives Rules, 2008, herein after referred to as the said rules, the clause (3)
shall be omitted:;

3. In rule 112 of the said rules, -

(@) in sub-rule (1), for the words “five financial years”, the words "ten financial years” shall be
substituted;



[¢TRT [I—=vE 3(i)] T T TSI © T 3

(b) in sub-rule (8), for the words “five years” the words “ten years” shall be substituted.
[F. No. 2(3)/2019-Expl-Part(4)]
Dr. SANDHYA BHULLAR, Jt. Secy.
Note.- The principal rules were published in Gazette of India, Extraordinary vide notification number
G.S.R. 907(E), dated the 29th December, 2008 and subsequently amended vide notification number

G.S.R. 65(E), dated 24™January, 2011, G.S.R. 772(E), dated the 11"December, 2013, G.S.R. 17 (E)
dated 9" January 2019 and G.S.R.633(E) dated 11th October, 2024.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. goaxia natH vaDAvA Saetsmess comsanmiaone



		2025-05-02T15:27:05+0530
	GORAKHA NATH YADAVA




